T01-01103-DAAA

TB9435S-100H

T01-01121-DBBA

TBAS062

TBASO71

TBA30A0-0200

219-01561-00

TBAA03-13

TBC101A

SS-SN4E

Reciter, TB9400, 148-174MHz

CHASSIS, TB9400, SINGLE, 100w

TB94 Linear PA 148-174M 100Watts

SI'l: SIMULCAST ENABLE (TB91/94)

SFE IP NETWORKING SATELLITE

TBY000 Power Management Unit AC with Aux24volts
CABLE, PMU IEC, 6.5FT

Support Bracket

E&M Isolation Adapter

Extended Warranty 5 years

ShIppiug

Tax at 7.25%

VT-4E150-00-800 (TRANSMITTR MT-4E,VHF 136-174MHz)
VR-4E150-00-000 (RX MT-4E VHF136-174MHz,CLASS B)
AMP-4-150-30-00 (AMPLIFIER/MT-4, 136-174MHz,30W)

SM-3-H0-014-00 (SYSTEM REGULATOR,9-11 VDC,14HP)

:SR-39-1 (SUBRACK, 96 PIN + 1/0,STANDARD)
‘CBLCA46-12506025 (Cable, RJ-45 to RJ45 25¢m)

CBL223 (CABLE/RF, RG223U)

L3 Harris
S

$

1,806.70

894.60

1,427.30

3.311.00

532.70

1,322.30

9.10 !

24,50 '

49.70

358.51

9,736.41

175.00

705.89

10,617.30

L3 Harris revised

$

$

Fisher Wireless

1,755.08 No Bid

869.04

1,386.52

3,216.40

517.48

1,700.68

8.84

23.80

48.28

358.51

9,884.63

150.00

716.64

10,751.27

Codan Comm
No Bid

Silverado Avionics
No Bid

Precision Wireless
No Bid




3 6,370.72 S 8,515.00
‘Shipping $ 40.00

Tax at 7.25% S 461.88 $ 617.34

$ 6,872.60 3 9,132.34




